
No one knows why

Too much heat, too cold, floods, extreme weather events, and more. Leaving aside 
those who still believe that everything that happens is normal, scientists do not give 
credit to what is happening, and much less can explain the reason for so much 
disaster with so much frequency and violence.

There has been much talk and there is still talked, but there is reason for it; The 
events to which we are witnessing in recent years, and that are increasing no one can 
say what is causing them, in my opinion this is the most disturbing. Many think that 
the culprit may be the “famous” HAARP, in theory it is not crazy because it has been 
proven that it can generate all kinds of natural disasters, including earthquakes. But 
nothing can be said without proof.

Some theories have been proposed, but none of them makes mention of global 
warming, at least all those who know for sure that this is not the cause. One of the 
theories refers to what has been mentioned on other occasions, and that surely many
people ignore, a mini ice age. The problem is that many associates the intense heat in 
some countries with the increase of the temperature of the planet, caused by the 
human, this is what is said, and that has been proven in numerous occasions that is 
not certain.

Some time ago scientists were warning of the arrival of a mini ice age, something that 
has already happened in the past and is sure to happen again. The proof of this is that
our sun is going through a phase of very low activity, this has been observed for a 
long time, which has led to this conclusion. But as misfortunes never come alone, the 
sun also protects us from cosmic rays, but only when it is in full activity, which means 
that now these rays can affect the human being at a certain height, more properly 
speaking, those who travel By plane. As I have said on other occasions, our sun gives 
us life; But it can also be taken away.

But we must not forget that even though the sun is passing through a low activity 
stage, solar storms and coronal mass ejections can occur at any time and without 
warning, in fact is already happening. It has been in Central America where a coronal 
mass ejection has left thousands of people without electricity for a short time, 
fortunately.

Another theory refers to a cosmic influence, which means that it is something that is 
disturbing in such a way that it is changing the planet's climate cycles and is leading 
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them to an extreme point, and as we are proving this is increasing; It is said that we 
are on the verge of a global catastrophe.

It is also speculated with the influence of the planets that are in approach to our solar 
system, the already very named planet 9, and the recently found planet 10, but also 
we are with Nemesis, the twin sister of our sun. Some of them could be influencing 
the sun negative way, and in turn the sun to us, remember that planet 9 would be at 
least 8 to 9 times the size of the earth, implying a huge influence on us, even if It is not
very close yet. Of course, none of this can be proved yet, but neither can be ruled out.

For some time now we are seeing two suns in our skies, the most skeptical say that it 
is the reflection of the sun itself in the ice crystals of the atmosphere, but it has been 
shown that this is not so, this other sun is Nemesis, a Twin of our sun that would 
happen every 26000 years, more or less. It is believed that it is influencing the sun, 
and that this influence is the; Causing the anomalies in the earth.

For many years our modern society has lived without any natural disasters of which 
one had to worry, when something that went out of the ordinary rarely occurred, we 
did not pay much attention, and scientists know this; Because otherwise they would 
not be worried today. Our past is full of natural disasters that have marked our 
history in one way or another, and the ancients knew that it would happen again, and 
they have told us in many ways.

My personal theory is that we are going through cycles of change at the cosmic and 
planetary level, which we will have to face, one way or another.


